BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE SEAFRONT (VARIOUS RESTRICTIONS)
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.3 2012

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19,
32, 35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, | 17 and 124 (1) (c)
& (d) of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6
of the Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation
with the Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part |1l of Schedule 9 to the 1984
Act hereby makes the above named Order.

s
The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the | day of M 2012
and amend the Brighton & Hove Seafront (Various Restrictions) Consolidation Order
2008, as amended, as follows:-

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Part 2.1 No loading/unioading At Any time
Delete item |: New Steine, Brighton

Delete item 2: New Steine, Brighton
Delete item 3: New Steine, Brighton
Delete item 4: New Steine, Brighton

Part 3.1 Pay and Display Parking Places - Monday to Sunday 9.00am to
6.00pm '
Delete itern 27: Madeira Drive, Brighton

Amend item 28 Madeira Drive: delete “422 metres” and substitute “405 metres”
delete 55 metres” and substitute “73 metres”

Add item 28a: Madeira Drive — North side — 4.6 metres wide. Extending from a point
366.8 metres east of the eastern side of the Palace Pier Forecourt eastwards for a
distance of 4.8 metres (At an angle of 90 deg. To the nearest edge of the carriageway)

Part 5.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Places 24 hours of any day

Add new item |3: New Steine — West side (Eastern Arm)- From a point 17.5 metres
south of the southern kerbline of St James’s Street southwards for a distance of 6.6
metres

Part 6.2 Solo Motorcycles Parking Bay Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
Amend item |2 New Steine: delete “East side” and substitute “West side” delete “4.5
metres” and substitute *13.5 metres” delete “5.5 metres” and substitute “4 metres"



THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 26" day of )

Apnl Two Thousand and [welve )
in the presence of

(L~

Authorised Person




